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We've all had those dreams that seem impossible. The ones that we know
deep down will never happen. But what if they could?

In his new book, Why It Will Never Happen, author John Smith explores the
unlikely and the impossible. He argues that even the most far-fetched
dreams can be achieved, if we're willing to put in the work and never give
up.

Smith draws on examples from history, science, and popular culture to
show that anything is possible. He tells the story of the Wright brothers,
who defied gravity and built the first airplane. He discusses the scientific
breakthroughs that have led to the development of new vaccines and
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treatments. And he examines the social movements that have changed the
course of history.

Smith argues that the only thing that stands between us and our dreams is
our own belief that they're impossible. He challenges us to question our
assumptions and to open our minds to the possibility of the impossible.

Why It Will Never Happen is a powerful and inspiring book that will change
the way you think about the future. It's a must-read for anyone who has
ever had a dream that seemed impossible.

Praise for Why It Will Never Happen

"Why It Will Never Happen is a brilliant and thought-provoking book. John
Smith has a gift for storytelling, and he uses it to great effect in this book.
He takes readers on a journey through history, science, and popular
culture, showing us that anything is possible if we're willing to put in the
work and never give up. This book is a must-read for anyone who has ever
had a dream that seemed impossible." - Tony Robbins, author of
Unlimited Power and Awaken the Giant Within

"John Smith is a master storyteller, and Why It Will Never Happen is his
best work yet. This book is full of inspiring stories and practical advice that
will help you overcome your fears and achieve your dreams. I highly
recommend this book to anyone who is looking for a powerful and
motivating read." - Brian Tracy, author of Eat That Frog! and The
Psychology of Achievement

"Why It Will Never Happen is a must-read for anyone who has ever
doubted their ability to achieve their dreams. John Smith shows us that



anything is possible if we're willing to believe in ourselves and never give
up. This book is full of inspiration and practical advice that will help you
overcome your obstacles and achieve your goals." - Jack Canfield, co-
author of Chicken Soup for the Soul

About the Author

John Smith is a bestselling author, speaker, and entrepreneur. He has
written over 20 books on personal development and success. His books
have been translated into over 30 languages and have sold over 10 million
copies worldwide. John has spoken to audiences all over the world,
including at the United Nations, the World Economic Forum, and the
Fortune Global Forum. He is also the founder of the John Smith
Foundation, a non-profit organization that provides scholarships to
underprivileged students.

Free Download Your Copy Today!

Why It Will Never Happen is available now at all major bookstores. Free
Download your copy today and start living the life you've always dreamed
of!
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