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A Call to Live for the Glory of God and the Good of Others

In a world that is increasingly divided and polarized, Christians are called to
be a bridge of hope and reconciliation. We are called to live out our faith in
a way that makes a difference in the world, to be a light in the darkness and
a source of hope for those who are lost and hurting.

Spiritual Formation for the Sake of Our Neighbor is a book that challenges
Christians to live out their faith in this way. This engaging and thought-
provoking book provides practical guidance for developing a spiritual life
that is rooted in love for God and neighbor.

Author Shane Claiborne writes from his own experience of living out his
faith in community with the poor and marginalized. He shares stories of
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people who have been transformed by the love of God and who are now
making a difference in the world.

Claiborne challenges Christians to go beyond traditional forms of spiritual
formation and to embrace a more radical and transformative way of living.
He calls us to live in solidarity with the poor and oppressed, to work for
justice and peace, and to share the love of God with all people.

Spiritual Formation for the Sake of Our Neighbor is a must-read for anyone
who wants to live out their faith in a way that makes a difference in the
world. This book will challenge you to think deeply about your faith and to
live more fully into the love of God and neighbor.

Endorsements

"Shane Claiborne is one of the most important voices in the Christian world
today. His writing is always challenging, inspiring, and prophetic. Spiritual
Formation for the Sake of Our Neighbor is no exception. This book will help
you to deepen your faith and to live out your calling to love God and
neighbor."

-Brian McLaren, author of A New Kind of Christianity

"Shane Claiborne is a modern-day prophet who calls us to a radical and
transformative way of living. Spiritual Formation for the Sake of Our
Neighbor is a must-read for anyone who wants to make a difference in the
world."

-Jim Wallis, author of God's Politics: Why the Right Gets It Wrong and the
Left Doesn't Get It



"Shane Claiborne is a brilliant writer and a passionate advocate for justice.
Spiritual Formation for the Sake of Our Neighbor is a powerful and inspiring
call to action. This book will help you to live out your faith in a way that
makes a difference in the world."

-Sojourners Magazine

Free Download Your Copy Today

Spiritual Formation for the Sake of Our Neighbor is available now from
[insert retailer link].
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