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Maggie Smith was born with a rare skin condition that left her with large,
red birthmarks covering her body. As a child, she was often stared at and
teased by her peers. She grew up feeling ashamed of her body and
desperately tried to hide her birthmarks.

But as she got older, Maggie realized that she couldn't keep living her life in
fear. She decided to embrace her birthmarks and share her story with the
world. In 2013, she founded One Naked Baby, a nonprofit organization that
empowers people with visible differences to love and accept themselves.

One Naked Baby has become a global movement, with chapters in over 20
countries. Maggie's story has inspired countless people to embrace their
own unique beauty and to challenge the unrealistic beauty standards that
society often imposes on us.
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In her new memoir, One Naked Baby, Maggie shares her personal journey
of self-acceptance and empowerment. She writes about the challenges she
faced growing up with a visible difference, the lessons she learned along
the way, and the importance of loving yourself unconditionally.

One Naked Baby is an inspiring and empowering story that will resonate
with anyone who has ever struggled with body image issues or self-doubt.
Maggie Smith's journey is a reminder that we are all beautiful in our own
way and that we should never let anyone tell us otherwise.

Praise for One Naked Baby

"Maggie Smith is a true inspiration. Her story is a powerful reminder that we
should all embrace our own unique beauty and never let anyone tell us
otherwise." - Oprah Winfrey

"One Naked Baby is a must-read for anyone who has ever struggled with
body image issues or self-doubt. Maggie Smith's journey is a powerful
reminder that we are all beautiful in our own way." - Reese Witherspoon

"Maggie Smith's story is one of courage, resilience, and self-acceptance.
One Naked Baby is an inspiring memoir that will empower you to love
yourself unconditionally." - Glennon Doyle

About Maggie Smith

Maggie Smith is a writer, speaker, and activist. She is the founder of One
Naked Baby, a nonprofit organization that empowers people with visible
differences to love and accept themselves. Maggie has been featured in
numerous media outlets, including The New York Times, The Washington



Post, and The Ellen DeGeneres Show. She lives in California with her
husband and two children.
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One Naked Baby is available for Free Download at all major bookstores
and online retailers. To Free Download your copy today, click here: [link to
Free Download book]
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